Tabulation Regarding Snow Removal Services

Proposal 24-10 Crown Services Grassman Lawn Service J & L Landscaping & Concrete LLC | |L & L Concrete [M & P Excavating, Inc. Native Construction [Seasons Maintenance
Date: November 11, 2010 Kenosha, Wisconsin Union Grove, Wisconsin Kenosha, Wisconsin Kenosha, Wisconsin |Kenosha, Wisconsin Kenosha, Wisconsin [Spring Grove, lllinois
Notes:
Proposal Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Item Item Description Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A Sidewalk Snow Removal

City-Owned Parcels: (KHA) Per Month $1,155.001X 4 | $4,620.00 $4,737.63X 4 | $18,950.52 | |No Bid X4 $1,200.00)X 4 | $4,800.00 No Bid X4 $2,992.00X 4 | $11,968.00 $6,585.00X4 | $26,340.00
B Sidewalk Snow Removal

City-Owned Parcels:

Redevelopment Authority Per Month $1,055.00X 4 | $4,220.00 $4,342.30X 4 | $17,369.20 | |No Bid X4 $1,100.00)X 4 | $4,400.00 No Bid X4 $2,618.00X 4 | $10,472.00 $4,825.00X4 | $19,300.00

C Sidewalk Snow Removal

City-Owned Parcels:

Miscellaneous Per Month $655.00X 4 | $2,620.00 $8,865.32|X 4 | $35,461.28 | |No Bid X4 $600.00(X 4 | $2,400.00 No Bid X4 $1,496.00X 4 | $5,984.00 $2,150.00)X 4 $8,600.00
D Sidewalk Snow Removal

City-Owned Parcels (NSP) Per Month $455.00X 4 | $1,820.00 $4,854.32|X 4| $19,417.28 | [No Bid X4 $600.00(X 4 | $2,400.00 No Bid X4 $1,309.00X 4 | $5,236.00 $1,235.00)X 4 $4,940.00

Total: Proposal Iltem A-D $13,280.00 $91,198.28 $14,000.00 $33,660.00 $59,180.00
E Sidewalk Snow Removal

Public Works Department Per L.F. $0.84 $0.75 N/A $0.94 N/A $0.80 $0.15|

Estimated Total: Proposal ltem E $12,948.60 $11,561.25 $14,490.10 $12,332.00 $2,312.25

(based upon historical average of

15,415 lineal feet)

Estimated Total for Sidewalk $26,228.60 $102,759.53 $28,490.10 $45,992.00 $61,492.25
Snow Removal (Items A-E)
F(a) |Plowing of Transit Lots: Per Event

Lot #3 No Bid $60.00 $120.00) $105.00) $209.00 $95.00 $70.00

Lot #6 No Bid $150.00 $35.00 $105.00 $104.50 $90.00] $50.00]

Lot #16 No Bid $100.00) $120.00) $140.00) $237.50 $115.00 $70.00

Lot #21 No Bid $70.00 $40.00 $70.00 $104.50 $105.00 $95.00

Lot #23 No Bid $400.00) $180.00) $240.00) $313.50 $120.00 $225.00

McCarthy Transit Center No Bid $200.00 No Bid $105.00 $451.25) $110.00 $485.00

F(b)  |Salting of Transit Lots: Per Event

Lot #3 No Bid $50.00 $120.00) $90.00 $60.80 $34.00 $65.00

Lot #6 No Bid $70.00 $30.00 $60.00 $30.40] $34.00] $45.00]

Lot #16 No Bid $70.00 $120.00] $120.00] $70.30 $34.00 $65.00

Lot #21 No Bid $50.00 $40.00 $60.00 $30.40 $30.00 $90.00

Lot #23 No Bid $170.00) $120.00) $150.00) $95.00 $34.00 $200.00

McCarthy Transit Center No Bid $100.00 No Bid $120.00 $133.00 $30.00 $300.00

Response Time 2 hours 1-2 hours 30 minutes 4 hours 1 hour 30 minutes 1.5 hours

Addendum #1 Acknowledgment Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

Insurance Questionnaire Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Ordinances Reviewed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Payment Terms 5%, 10 Net, 30 Net 30 Net 30 1%, 10 Net, 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 15

Ability to Add 20 Parcels Yes Yes N/A Yes N/A Yes Yes

Adjustment Price for Additions/

Deletions per I.f./month $0.55/ I.f./month $0.50/ If./month N/A $0.30/1.f./month (+) N/A $0.80/1.f./month $0.15/1.f./month (+
$0.20/1.f./month (-) $0.05/1.f./month (-)

Minority-Owned Business No No Yes No No

[No No
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