
Tabulation Regarding Snow Removal Services
Proposal 22-11 CLJ Enterprises LLC Crown Services LLC J & L Concrete M & P Excavating, Inc. Native Construction Snow Systems, Inc. Williamson Construction

Date: September 27, 2011 Racine, WI Wheeling, IL
Notes:

Proposal Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Item Item Description Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A Sidewalk Snow Removal
City-Owned Parcels: (KHA) Per Month $5,106.00 $1,155.00 $1,065.00 No Bid No Bid $1,100.00 $2,600.00 $1,181.25 No Bid

B Sidewalk Snow Removal
City-Owned Parcels: 
Redevelopment Authority Per Month $6,641.00 $1,055.00 $1,386.00 No Bid No Bid $1,000.00 $2,400.00 $1,536.50 No Bid

C Sidewalk Snow Removal
City-Owned Parcels:
Miscellaneous Per Month $5,887.00 $1,155.00 $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00 $1,400.00 $1,825.00 No Bid

D Sidewalk Snow Removal
City-Owned Parcels (NSP) Per Month $1,216.00 $455.00 $254.00 No Bid No Bid $440.00 $1,200.00 $425.00 $600.00

Total: Proposal Item A-D

E Sidewalk Snow Removal
Public Works Department Per L.F. $1.18 $0.90 $0.30 No Bid No Bid $0.72 $0.80 $1.85 $0.85

Estimated Total: Proposal Item E
 (based upon historical average of
 15,415 lineal feet)

Estimated Total for Sidewalk
Snow Removal (Items A-E)

F(a) Plowing of Transit Lots: Per Event
Lot #3 $88.50 No Bid $50.00 $45.00 $100.00 $50.00 $75.00 $150.00 No Bid
Lot #6 $65.00 No Bid $95.00 $50.00 $100.00 $30.00 $75.00 $150.00 No Bid
Lot #16 $88.50 No Bid $75.00 $50.00 $115.00 $75.00 $85.00 $150.00 No Bid
Lot #21 $65.00 No Bid $60.00 $45.00 $110.00 $30.00 $85.00 $150.00 No Bid
Lot #23 $147.50 No Bid $110.00 $90.00 $145.00 $90.00 $85.00 $150.00 No Bid
McCarthy Transit Center $118.00 No Bid $110.00 $90.00 $135.00 $70.00 $85.00 $150.00 No Bid

F(b) Salting of Transit Lots: Per Event
Lot #3 $115.00 No Bid $50.00 $60.00 $32.00 $30.00 $40.00 $125.00 No Bid
Lot #6 $85.00 No Bid $70.00 $60.00 $32.00 $30.00 $30.00 $125.00 No Bid
Lot #16 $115.00 No Bid $70.00 $60.00 $32.00 $30.00 $40.00 $125.00 No Bid
Lot #21 $85.00 No Bid $55.00 $60.00 $32.00 $30.00 $40.00 $125.00 No Bid
Lot #23 $175.00 No Bid $70.00 $120.00 $32.00 $30.00 $50.00 $125.00 No Bid
McCarthy Transit Center $175.00 No Bid $70.00 $120.00 $90.00 $30.00 $50.00 $125.00 No Bid

Response Time 1 hour 1 hour 30 minutes 30 minutes 1 hour 30 minutes 1 hour 2 hours 1 hour
Insurance Questionnaire Yes File Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Ordinances Reviewed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Payment Terms Net, 30 days 5%,10 Net 30 5%,15 Net, 30 Net, 30 days Net 30 Net 30 Net, 30 3%, 15 Net, 30 Net, 15
Ability to Add 20 Parcels Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Adjustment Price for Additions/ $1.43/lf/mo $.55/lf/mo $.30/lf/mo $.72/lf/mo $.70/lf/mo $2.00/lf/mo No Price
 Deletions per l.f./month $1.10/lf/mo $.363/lf/mo $.30/lf/mo $.72/lf/mo $.40/lf/mo $.50/lf/mo No Price

50 lf minimum (per property)

Minority-Owned Business No No No Yes No Yes No No No

Dreamscape Lawncare Mohr's Construction
Kenosha, WI Kenosha, WI Kenosha, WI Kenosha, WI Kenosha, WI Kansasville, WI Kenosha, WI
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